
TERMS OF SERVICE 
DISCLAIMER 
Effective: February 2021 

Oh My Baby Brain (“Ohmybabybrain“, “OMBB” “we”, “us” and/or “our”) hereby states 
that by using the Site, you agree to be bound by these Terms of Service that follow, written in 
accordance with these Terms of Service, our Privacy Policy and any additional terms and 
conditions that may apply to specific sections of the Site or to products and services available 
through the Site. 

The reading of information on this website is of your own free will and if you do not accept 
the terms contained in this disclaimer, you should cease the use of this website. 
(Ohmybabybrain.com reserves the right to change any of these terms at any given time.) 

All views that are expressed here represent only those made by the OMBB team. Whatever 
opinion we may put across does not intend to harm, slander, or defame any company, 
individual, or thing. We will not be held liable for libel nor will we be held to compensate 
you in any way whatsoever if you ever happen to suffer a loss/inconvenience/damage 
because of what we may displayed or stated on our website. We will not be responsible for 
the actions of individuals who follow this adventure resource site. 

We are committed to provide up-to-date information, but can’t make representations or 
warranties of any kind, express or implied, about the completeness, accuracy, reliability, 
suitability or availability with respect to the website or the information, products, or services. 
The Site contains a large amount of data, and errors are likely to occur in tracking changes – 
for example, changes in dates and times of events. We therefore do not accept any liability 
for error or omission with regards to content of the Site. Should you find any inaccurate 
information on the Site, please inform us at contact@ohmybabybrain.com and we shall 
correct it as soon as it is practicable to do so. 

INTELLECTUAL & COPYRIGHT POLICY 
All photos and text used in this site are intellectual properties of Oh My Baby Brain unless 
otherwise stated. Additionally: unless otherwise noted, we are also the legal copyright holder 
of the material on this website and it may not be used, reprinted, (partially) modified, or 
published without our permission, especially if it’s for commercial use. If you would like to 
use any of the photos or text found in this website, please get in touch with the team stating 
your intention and purpose for such. 

The Site is provided solely for your personal noncommercial use. You may not use the Site or 
the materials available on the which has not been authorized by us. More specifically, you 
may not modify, copy, reproduce, republish, upload, post, translate, sell, create derivative 
works, exploit, or distribute in any manner or medium (including by email or other electronic 
means) any material from the Site without prior permission. You may, however, download, 
print, and/or share one copy of individual pages of the Site for non-commercial use, provided 
that you credit us accordingly. 



By posting or submitting any material (including, without limitation, comments, blog entries, 
Facebook postings, photos and videos) you are representing that you are the owner of the 
material, or are making your posting or submission with the express consent of the owner of 
the material. In addition, when you submit, email, text or deliver or post any material, you are 
granting us, and anyone authorized by us, a royalty-free, perpetual, irrevocable, non-
exclusive, unrestricted, worldwide license to use, copy, modify, transmit, sell, create 
derivative works from, distribute, and/or publicly perform or display such material, in whole 
or in part, in any manner or medium, now known or hereafter developed, for any purpose. 

Oh My Baby Brain creates all our content and source our images via Creative Commons or 
licensed stock photos. All photos are properly credited, however, if we have missed any, 
please send us a message and we will immediately remove it. You can send the notice to 
contact@ohmybabybrain.com. 

OTHER CONTENT MATTERS 
Meanwhile, comments on this website are the sole responsibility of their writers and they will 
take full responsibility, liability, and blame for any libel or proceedings that will result from 
their statement. We do not guarantee the accuracy, honesty and politeness of their comments. 
Though of course, we reserve the rights to edit or delete any comments submitted to this 
website without notice as they may deem to be spam or questionable spam, or that they 
include profanity, contain language or concepts that are offensive, attack a group or person 
individually, etc. 
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